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BI hikes by 25bps amid IDR pressure 

 
  

 
 Wednesday, August 15, 2018 

 
Highlights 

 Bank Indonesia (BI) has chosen to hike the benchmark rate by another 

25bps bringing it to 5.50%. This means that to date for this year, the central 

bank has cumulatively raised rates by 125 bps. This came as the pressure on the 

Turkish Lira also receded. The current account for 2Q 2018 had also widened to 

3.0% of GDP whilst the trade balance also turned negative for July 2018 at -

US$2030m (June 2018: US$1743m). The central bank said in its press release 

that this is consistent with the efforts to maintain the attractiveness of the 

domestic financial market and control the current account deficit within a safe 

limit. BI believes that the Fed will continue to gradually raise the fed fund rate 

amid what they believe will be a strengthening US economy. The central bank 

also believes that growth will be at 5.0% - 5.4% for 2018. BI also said that its 

policy in increasing the effectiveness of providing foreign currency swaps with 

lower prices was able to increase the interest of bidders in various tenors and 

reduce market swap premiums, for example from 4.85% to 4.62% for 1-month 

tenors and from 5.18% to 4.96% for a 1-year tenor. They expect that inflation 

would be maintained in their target range of 3.5%+1% yoy for this year.  

 This rate hike comes as the government itself has also implemented other 

policies to try to stem the IDR decline. Just yesterday, President Jokowi had 

held a cabinet meeting to discuss on the forex reserves. Finance Minister Sri 

Mulyani then announced that the government “will take firm and drastic measures 

to control imports” and that they “have identified consumption goods and raw 

materials that can be substituted with domestic products”. The government plans 

to impose a 7.5% tax on imports of select products deemed as not strategic for 

the economy. The government will also ask state-owned refiner PT Pertamina 

and electricity producer to review imports of capital goods. The two companies 

will also need to postpone infrastructure projects that are yet to tie up funds, 

according to Sri Mulyani. All request for capital goods imports by these 

companies will be suspended for the next six month or until the balance of 

payment is improved. The government is also working to mandate the use of 20% 

percent blended palm biodiesel in more sectors. This is estimated to cut crude oil 

imports by about US$2.3bn for this year.  

 Going forward, we expect that BI could still further raise rates this year. The 

central bank itself has already recognized the possibility of the Fed further raising 

rates and this could come to put pressure on BI to also further raise rates. The 

prospect of further trade tensions between the US and China or the US with other 

countries could further dampened sentiment towards the currency. In other parts 

of the economy, our expectation is for growth to come out at 5.1% yoy, which is at 

the lower end of the official central bank forecast.   
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This publication is solely for information purposes only and may not be published, circulated, reproduced or distributed in 
whole or in part to any other person without our prior written consent. This publication should not be construed as an 
offer or solicitation for the subscription, purchase or sale of the securities/instruments mentioned herein. Any forecast on 
the economy, stock market, bond market and economic trends of the markets provided is not necessarily indicative of the 
future or likely performance of the securities/instruments. Whilst the information contained herein has been compiled 
from sources believed to be reliable and we have taken all reasonable care to ensure that the information contained in 
this publication is not untrue or misleading at the time of publication, we cannot guarantee and we make no 
representation as to its accuracy or completeness, and you should not act on it without first independently verifying its 
contents. The securities/instruments mentioned in this publication may not be suitable for investment by all investors. Any 
opinion or estimate contained in this report is subject to change without notice. We have not given any consideration to 
and we have not made any investigation of the investment objectives, financial situation or particular needs of the 
recipient or any class of persons, and accordingly, no warranty whatsoever is given and no liability whatsoever is 
accepted for any loss arising whether directly or indirectly as a result of the recipient or any class of persons acting on 
such information or opinion or estimate. This publication may cover a wide range of topics and is not intended to be a 
comprehensive study or to provide any recommendation or advice on personal investing or financial planning. 
Accordingly, they should not be relied on or treated as a substitute for specific advice concerning individual situations. 
Please seek advice from a financial adviser regarding the suitability of any investment product taking into account your 
specific investment objectives, financial situation or particular needs before you make a commitment to purchase the 
investment product. OCBC Bank, its related companies, their respective directors and/or employees (collectively 
“Related Persons”) may or might have in the future interests in the investment products or the issuers mentioned herein. 
Such interests include effecting transactions in such investment products, and providing broking, investment banking and 
other financial services to such issuers. OCBC Bank and its Related Persons may also be related to, and receive fees 
from, providers of such investment products. 

This report is intended for your sole use and information. By accepting this report, you agree that you shall not share, 
communicate, distribute, deliver a copy of or otherwise disclose in any way all or any part of this report or any information 
contained herein (such report, part thereof and information, “Relevant Materials”) to any person or entity (including, 
without limitation, any overseas office, affiliate, parent entity, subsidiary entity or related entity) (any such person or 
entity, a “Relevant Entity”) in breach of any law, rule, regulation, guidance or similar. In particular, you agree not to share, 
communicate, distribute, deliver or otherwise disclose any Relevant Materials to any Relevant Entity that is subject to the 
Markets in Financial Instruments Directive (2014/65/EU) (“MiFID”) and the EU’s Markets in Financial Instruments 
Regulation (600/2014) (“MiFIR”) (together referred to as “MiFID II”), or any part thereof, as implemented in any 
jurisdiction. No member of the OCBC Group shall be liable or responsible for the compliance by you or any Relevant 
Entity with any law, rule, regulation, guidance or similar (including, without limitation, MiFID II, as implemented in any 
jurisdiction). 
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